
Sunday, 14th May Monday, 15th May Tuesday, 16 th May Wednesday, 17 th May Thursday, 18 th May Friday, 19 th May Saturday, 20th May

 Finland: plane  and train, 
arrival                                 
9:30 Official welcome at 
school                               
10:00  Guided school tour  
Coffee break at school       
Mixed teams create a 
special guide "Questions 
for an entrepreneur"   
(vote for the best)               

 8:30 Sustainable 
breakfast                     
9:00 Business 
competition with  
Entrepreneurs           

9:00 Guided tour through 
the city center of Chalon 
sur Saône                         

Our Finish partners go 
back to Finland               
BUS 9:00 Departure for 
Cluny   ; guided tour with 
tablettes                       

9:00 Mini companies 
presentation                    
Coffee break                   
PowerPoint  "Check all 
collaborative work for 
Erasmus project" 

Departure of our partners

13:00 Lunch at school 13:00 Lunch at school

13:00 Lunch at a 
Burgundian Restaurant 
"Maison des vins" No 
frog no snails

 12:00 Lunch at special 
restaurant (social and 
solidarity economy ) "Le 
pain";little company, 
Cluny

Arrival of partners :       
Italy: plane and train     
Wales: plane and train

14:00 Visit of Saint 
Gobain Veralia  Wearing 
closed shoes is obligatory 
(and no recommended 
high-heeled shoes)        

14:00-17:00 serious 
game  for 
entrepreneurship               
Each one eat "quickly"      
19h30 departure for 
Basket-ball match, Elan 
is a famous local team

Bus 14:30  Visit a 
company: David Lefort in 
Rully; testing our guide  
"Questions for an 
entrepreneur"                     
16:00   Marketing 
vocabulary; What did you 
learn during our project?: 
test with Kahoot        
17:00  Coordinators 
meeting

14:00- 16:30 Visit a 
company Saint Laurent 
GAEC; testing our guide  
"Questions for an 
entrepreneur"                     
19:00  Bowling : meal 
and game

12:00  Discover the Saone 
River, Cruising in the 
heart of Burgundy ; 
Lunch  cruise    and 
official farewell  and  
final debriefing of our 
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